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Greenwich Hospital Joins Elite List as a National Caring Science 
Affiliate of Watson Caring Science Institute 

 
Deerfield Beach, FL: Watson Caring Science Institute (WCSI) and Dr. Jean Watson are proud to 
announce that Greenwich Hospital has been named the latest National Caring Science Affiliate of 
WCSI. This prestigious designation highlights Greenwich Hospital’s exemplary integration of Human 
Caring Theory and its leadership's dedication to fostering Watson’s Caring Science practices for 
patients, families and staff throughout its healthcare system. 
 
“Greenwich Hospital has demonstrated an unwavering commitment to the principles of Human 
Caring Science,” says Dr. Jean Watson, Founder and Director of Watson Caring Science Institute. 
“Their focus on creating compassionate and healing environments aligns beautifully with our vision 
of care that honors the dignity and humanity of all individuals.” 
 
“This affiliation affirms Greenwich Hospital’s commitment to putting patients first through 
evidence-based, caring, scientific practices,” said Diane Kelly, DNP, RN, President of Greenwich 
Hospital and Chief Nursing Executive, Yale New Haven Health. “We are honored to partner with 
WCSI as we continue to innovate and prioritize the well-being of our community.” 
 
Greenwich Hospital’s new designation as a National Caring Science Affiliate reinforces its leadership 
in patient-centered care. This partnership is expected to strengthen its initiatives in creating healing 
environments and promoting holistic care practices aligned with Watson’s Caring Science 
philosophy. 
 
Greenwich Hospital is a member of Yale New Haven Health. Greenwich is a 206-bed regional 
medical center serving lower Fairfield County, Connecticut and Westchester County, New York. It is 
a major academic affiliate of Yale School of Medicine. Founded in 1903, Greenwich Hospital has 
evolved into a progressive medical center and teaching institution representing all medical 
specialties and offering a wide range of medical, surgical, diagnostic and wellness programs. 
Greenwich Hospital is recognized throughout the healthcare industry as a leader in service and 
patient satisfaction excellence. Greenwich Hospital has the prestigious Magnet designation from the 
American Nurses Credentialing Center, the nation’s highest honor of nursing excellence. 
www.greenwichhospital.org 
 
About Watson Caring Science Institute (WCSI): The Watson Caring Science Institute (WCSI) is an 
international non-profit organization that advances the philosophies, theories, and practices of 
Human Caring/Caring Science, founded by Jean Watson, Ph.D., RN, AHN-BC, FAAN, LL (AAN), WCSI’s 
Founder & Director. Focusing on research, education, praxis, leadership, and legacy, the institute 
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aims to widen the development and understanding of Watson’s Caring Science to inform our notion 
of quality care and healing environments through various educational programs, nurse scientific 
research, partnerships, events and affiliations. For more information, please visit 
www.watsoncaringscience.org. 
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